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	 Christmas
by Linville Dunaway, Corinth Christian Church 

 	 Someone said that it doesn’t seem like Christmas 
this year. Does it to you, or not? The stores didn’t play 
the Christmas music like they used to do, and I don’t 
remember hearing people speak of the season as they 
normally did. Most people are probably shopping for 
gifts as they always do. I’m afraid that for many of us, 
the gifts are a major part of Christmas. One thing I’ve 
noticed about those gifts, are the long lines of people in 
the stores after Christmas; returning, or exchanging the 
gifts that they received.
	 Does it take certain things to make it seem like 
Christmas to us? Some want snow so they can have the 
“White Christmas.” Somehow it makes them think of 
when they were young. There are many places where 
it never snows, but they have Christmas anyway. For 
others, it is a time when families get together, maybe for 
the only time of the year. All of these things are alright in 
our lives, but I hope we remember why we have Christ-
mas.
	 If we can remember that Christmas is a time to 
celebrate the birth of Jesus then we can be happy for 

the right reasons. We don’t have to have some material 
things, such as gifts, or snow to have Christmas. It is a 
shame that millions of people celebrate by drinking and 
going to parties, but they don’t believe in Jesus at all. 
They celebrate “Xmas” because they leave Christ out.
	 The bible doesn’t tell us to celebrate the birth of Je-
sus. We do because we are thankful that he came into 
this world to save us from sin and death. Isaiah 9:6, 
“For unto us a child is born, unto us a son is given: and 
the government shall be upon his shoulder: and his name 
shall be called Wonderful, Counsellor, The mighty God, 
The everlasting Father, The Prince of Peace.” The great-
est gift that was ever given was given, not by man, but 
by God. John 3:16, “For God so loved the world, that he 
gave his only begotten Son, that whosoever believeth in 
him should not perish, but have everlasting life.” Yes, God 
gave the gift of eternal life, through Jesus, the Christ.
	 The gift is offered, but it is up to each of us to accept 
it. Not everyone has, or will, as people choose what is 
important in their lives. So many settle for what gives 
them some temporary pleasure today and don’t con-
sider what is important for tomorrow. Like Esau they 
satisfy the flesh and think little of the future. They that 
have this way of living will be like Esau in the future as 
well, he wept bitterly when it was too late.

 	 Families celebrate Christmas in different ways and 
that is alright. The main thing to me is to not let the 
“things” take over and crowd out Jesus. Without him, 
not only would there be no Christmas, but there would 
be no salvation. We can’t stress too much just how im-
portant he is to us and the world. If we want to have life, 
and hope for the future, all we have to do is to place our 
faith in him and obey his word.
  	  Some folks will feel that this is not the usual Christ-
mas season. They will say that something is missing, 
or that it just doesn’t feel right. Maybe something will 
be different from the usual happenings that we have 
come to know. If so, it doesn’t change the fact that Jesus 
was born to be the Savior of the world and that we still 
remember his birth, life, death, and resurrection.
	 Thinking back over the years I remember older 
people talking about things they remember when they 
were young at Christmas. If they got an orange, or a piece 
of candy they thought it was a great Christmas. Now so 
many folks have so much and are not really thankful for 
any of it. Have we got to where we look for more and 
more to make us happy and still can’t find happiness? 
Ecclesiastes 5:10, “He that loveth silver shall not be 
satisfied with silver; nor he that loveth abundance with 
increase: this is also vanity.”
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