
	Is There Any Word From The LORD? (Part 2)
by Linville Dunaway, Corinth Christian Church

	 “When Jeremiah was entered into the dungeon, and into 
the cabins, and Jeremiah had remained there many days;  
Then Zedekiah the king sent, and took him out: and the king 
asked him secretly in his house, and said, Is there any word 
from the LORD? And Jeremiah said, There is: for, said he, 
thou shalt be delivered into the hand of the king of Babylon,” 
Jeremiah 37:16-17.
	 Do the scriptures seem to be out of date in this modern 
world? To some they are more fitting in the past when life 
was simpler. Now with the technology of today we seem 
to have less time to ourselves and can hardly go anywhere 
and be out of contact with others. Even in church, or a fu-
neral home, you often hear someone’s phone ring. I have 
seen two, or three, people at a table and each of them on their 
phones talking to, or texting, someone in another location. 
I’m sure that we’ve got more contact with other people, but 
we have less contact with God.
	 Many churches have less emphasis on the Word of God 
and more on social activities. Bible study and evening ser-
vices have been dropped at many congregations. Sunday 

school is not important to many church members and is in 
danger of being lost too. People say that they are too busy 
and have little or no time to come to these services. This re-
sults in folks having little knowledge of the bible and with 
the passing of time they drift farther away from the truth.
	 2 Thessalonians 2:3 tells of a “Falling away,” which is 
usually mentioned as a falling away in the number of people 
coming to church. While this is true it can also refer to a fall-
ing away from the true teaching of God’s Word.
	 Many have decided to stop preaching about doctrines that 
people don’t like. Hell is one that some churches and preach-
ers have stopped talking about. The excuse is that it scared 
people and so they just don’t want to talk about it. Jesus talk-
ed about it and so did the church so what gives modern man 
the authority to drop the subject? There are many doctrines 
in the bible that some people have decided to ignore. What 
will they say when they stand before the Lord? “Thus saith 
the LORD; Stand in the court of the LORD’S house, and 
speak unto all the cities of Judah, which come to worship 
in the LORD’S house, all the words that I command thee 
to speak unto them; diminish not a word:” Jeremiah 26:2.
	 So in this modern day in which we live we might ask the 
question, “Is there any word from the Lord? Consider this 
from Jonah 3:1-2, “And the word of the LORD came unto 

Jonah the second time, saying, 2 Arise, go unto Nineveh, that 
great city, and preach unto it the preaching that I bid thee.” 
These verses show that God had not changed his mind. Jo-
nah was to preach the same message that God had told him 
to in the first place. It is the same today, we are to preach the 
same message of salvation that God gave to man in the be-
ginning. The plan of salvation has not changed; we will need 
to obey and do what Jesus told us to do. We need to repent 
and seek to walk with God, not in a way that satisfies us, but 
in the way that God commanded.
	 We are told in scripture to seek first the Kingdom of God 
and his righteousness. That is still the command, but how 
many try to do that? A lot of people know more about their 
favorite sports team than they do about God’s Word. Have 
you noticed that the same persons who don’t have time to 
read the bible will know all about the ball game, finances, 
politics, and whatever else they are interested in? “For where 
your treasure is, there will your heart be also,” Matt 6:21.
	 If we are serious about living for the Lord then we know 
what we must do. Live for God, doing his will and listening 
to his word and not that of every deceiver and false teacher 
that comes along. God hasn’t changed, but, we had better 
change from giving lip service to actually walking with the 
Lord.
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